2022 @1 fAd® e o8

UL o S e R @ gl o (@@, W), WRE §)
(demer) fada®, 2022

TG oY &7 fee furenn @ wewt o1 @, W, Y ge) st 1994 #
LENICE RS ICR I

e
faeras
ARG RIS & gEa%d 9§ # Uiy o & el e gr1 g e e 9
sfafrafag fear sme—
1wt e wd yRa — (1) 59 SiRfRE @Y st et & el faema

(@)

& |l & (@0, W, U safl) (FeneE) srferfeEm, 2022 FEr S |

2) T8 IT—UTE ERT WA s § atrgEer gN gentra fafy §
LERRR

gRT 3 BT GO — TG o & el fRumeT & wewl @1 (39, 97,
Yo gofd) oRFm, 1904 (1995 @1 Reeh s 6) EFS wrEW A
R & wu A i) @ aR1 3 § —

SURT (1) # —

(@ “IRE TR IR’ TR B W W D R T AR B feRnfoq
o sIeem,

(T) T TR BYY T B WM W T TR g @ W W&l B
yfereenfua fasar Sem;

IIERT (2) § “3ORE TR I’ TR B WM W TEE TR VW7 TRl P
wfeenfia fear s,



~~

‘(TT)‘ IR (3) ¥ P TOR I WK b WM W T TR o sr?ﬁ.ai‘r

uferenfua fFam e,

@ SR @) ¥ TH R IR IR B WM W CUGE TR W IR B
yfcreenfia fosan ST,

(6) SWW4® U =N PR SuRT B |ifaTe fBar e, et

“(5) Wl PP B AT TS FEw B AuCH, @R By, ey, AeEd fewe,
T} 3 T oY THARM AR B WU H B T A U I o smem

3. ORI 6 BT WM — SRFTIH B URT 6 F Y IS FTAR TR IR D W W

4 ORI 6% B HEEH — 7 SRFEE B O 6% F T “TEE EWR TH AR B
WM TR TP g BUd” g} P gfceenfue fear smem;

5. IRT 8 BT WG — T SMALTTH B YR 8 B SWIRT (1) F Y AR ARG B AR
B YOI GRS G BUY” Ieal HI wfreenfua far S

6. GIRT 9 B WAL — Hol SAFRH o ORT 9 # AT "W TR U™ W PUd’ AR B
W R “Ig8 S9R B9 Teal $i ufoeenfia fear smem;



Iewdl 3R sRvl BT Rawor

fioe 7o W ¥ el A R ¥ g qEee ¥ gy B da} o w9 sk
rgemt/glawmelt # gfa @ A wmaR A oW & R w® N ergwa few w
w3t/ Sreen / SuTener / AA-WE / G WRas B A/ STer / GRTG srvat § R
T AU GHT T SId T 93141 ST 20y |

T YU, T ST & Reell WeR B Ruren @ vl (9w, w9, e
gafe ) Afefram, 1994 # WelRE P B fow Uy o & R @, v, dee
TIfe) (WaerF) sftfem, 2022 ® oW fhar T B | g9 fRTe gRT U ey 8
TR B, i 9 T @ W B e § i &)

v gl wRedl @Y AT R 3|

1

(@amer TEe)
= (A, = vg faurh o)



foxira smo=

T T & el fumaer et @ (Ja, W, UeE geie) (W)

ffram, 2022 3 Fifga wamal @ eRaE ¥g AfaRed aifife sadl @ TEha e
& ool o wfea = | s o |

zfu/”/k

(ST TEA)

W= (A, =g v e Fr)



g fuE wsEh s

TR I &3 el U & we @ (@, W, YR gefl) ()
RIFRM, 2022 AR arEfFeer qeTReIREl R faurdl wfdd dfos @ ART 81 Bxan 2|

ik
)

W @, v R a)



BILL NO. O of 2022

THE MEMBERS OF LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY OF THE NATIONAL CAPITAL TERRITORY OF DELHI
(SALARIES, ALLOWANCES, PENSION, ETC.) (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2022.

A
BILL

Further to amend the Members of the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries,
Allowances, Pension, etc.) Act, 1994.

Be it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of Delhi in the Seventy-second year
of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the Members of the Legislative Assembly of
the National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries, Allowances, Pension, etc.) (Amendment) Act, 2022.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the Lieutenant Governor may, by notification in the Official Gazette,
appoint.
2. Amendment of section 3. — In the Members of the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory

of Delhi (Salaries, Allowances, Pension, etc.) Act, 1994, (Delhi Act 06 of 1995) (hereinafter referred to as the principal
Act), in section 3, —

(a) insub-section (1)-

1 for the words “twelve thousand rupees”, the words “thirty thousand rupees”, shall be substituted;
(ii) for the words “one thousand rupees”, the words “one thousand five hundred rupees”, shall be
substituted;

(b) in sub-section (2), for the words “eighteen thousand rupees”, the words ~ “twenty five thousand rupees”,
shall be substituted;

(c) in sub-section (3), for the words “six thousand rupees”, the words “ten thousands rupees”, shall be
substituted;

(d) in sub- section (4), for the words “ren thousand rupees”, the words “fifteen thousand rupees”, shall be
substituted;

(e) after sub-section (4), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely.-

“(5) There shall be paid to each Member a sum of rupees one lakh as one time allowance for purchase of
laptop, personal computer, printer, mobile handset etc. for each term of office.”.

3. Amendment in section 6. — In the principal Act, in section 6, for the words “eight thousand rupees”, the
words “ten thousand rupees”, shall be substituted.

4. Amendment in section 6A.- In the principal Act, in section 6A, for the words “fifty thousand rupees”, the
words “one lakh rupees”, shall be substituted;

5. Amendment in section 8. — In the principal Act, in section 8, in sub-section (1), for the words, “four lakh
rupees”, the words “eight lakh rupees”, shall be substituted.

6. Amendment of section 9. — In the principal Act, in section 9, for the words ~ “seven thousand five hundred
rupees”, the words, “fifteen thousand rupees”, shall be substituted.




STATEMENT OF OBJECTS & REASONS

For some time past, there has been persistent demand from the MLAs for the
increase in their salaries and perks/ facilities having regard to the increase in the price
index. It was also felt that salaries/ perks/ facilities of Ministers/ Speaker/ Deputy

Speaker/ Leader of Opposition/ Chief Whip are a bit inadequate which should be upgraded
and enhanced to a commensurate extent.

For the purpose, the Members of the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital
Territory of Delhi (Salaries, Allowances, Pension, etc.) (Amendment) Act, 2022, has been
initiated to amend the Members of the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory
of Delhi (Salaries, Allowances, Pension, etc.) Act, 1994, This Bill proposes to increase the
salaries, allowances & other facilities of the Members of the Legislative Assembly of the

Government of National Capital Territory of Delhi, so as to facilitate them to work
effectively.

The Bill seeks to achieve the aforesaid objectives.
\ouf;f

_ (Kailash Gahlot)
Minister (Law, Justice & Legislative Affairs)



FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

For the implementation of the proposals contained in the Members of the Legislative
Assembly of the National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries, Allowances, Pension, etc.)

(Amendment) Act, 2022, there will be an additional annual recurring expenditure from the

Consolidated Fund of the National Capital Territory of Delhi.

(Kailash Gahlot)
Minister (Law, Justice & Legislative Affairs)



MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

The Members of the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of Delhi
(Salaries, Allowances, Pension, etc.) (Amendment) Act, 2022, does not seek to confer power

of legislation on any subordinate functionaries.

(A

/
(Kailash Gahlot)
Minister (Law, Justice & Legislative Affairs)



